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IPHONE FOR SENIORS FOR DUMMIES

Includes coverage of iPhones 12, 11, X, SE, 8, 7, and 6! When you're looking for the
most up-to-date information on your iPhone, look no further than this edition of iPhone
For Seniors For Dummies. It's fully updated to cover iOS 14, the software released in Fall
of 2020 that runs all iPhones dating back to the iPhone 6. It doesn't matter if you have a
brand new iPhone 12 or are sticking with the iPhone you've had for a few years. This
book will help you navigate your device. Written especially for iPhone owners who don't
need to know every detail of how their phone works, iPhone For Seniors For Dummies
sticks to clear, friendly, step-by-step information on the essentials you'll use every day. It
covers the basics of messaging with friends and family, using your iPhone as a web
browser, watching television shows or movies, and taking and sharing photos and videos.
* Get to know which iPhone you own * Upgrade to iOS 14 * Add contacts to your
Favorites list * Connect your iPhone to wifi * Track your well-being with the Health app *
Fix common problems when they occur When you're ready to build your skills and
become the go-to iPhone guru for your friends, iPhone For Seniors For Dummies offers
the insight you need to increase your know-how.

* Covers iPhone models back to iPhone 6s * Stay in-the-know with social networking apps
* Listen to music and share photos Unlock the potential of your iPhone You can get the
latest iPhone features by buying a new iPhone or upgrading your old iPhone to the latest
version of iOS. This fully updated guide will help you navigate either path to the latest,
greatest iPhone updates. iPhone expert Dwight Spivey takes you through the ins and
outs of updating your phone to iOS 14 and navigating the latest features. You'll enjoy
step-by-step instructions on everything from organizing your appointments to taking
incredible photographs. Learn how to manage your schedule and keep in touch with your
loved ones. Getting to know the iPhone has never been so simple Inside. * Discovering
what's new in iOS 14 * Making and taking calls * Accessing helpful utilities * Managing
email * Navigating the App Store * Using the calendar * Monitoring your health *
Customizing your iPhone
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